
Camdenton R-III School District 
Bids for 2013-2014 School Year 
Due June 24, 2013  -  10:00  a.m. 
 
 

   --Last Year’s— 
BID 

TIRES *TCI Tire Center 
Jefferson City Ozark O McKnight TCI Tire Center - Jefferson City 

 7/1/13-
12/31/13 

1/1/14-
6/30/14 

7/1/13-
12/31/13 

1/1/14-
6/30/14 

7/1/13-
12/31/13 

1/1/14-
6/30/14 7/1/12-12/31/12 1/1/13-6/30/13 

Firm Bid Yes **Yes ***Yes YES 

         
10 R 22.5 
Michelin recap XDHT and casing – tubeless 
Michelin recap XDHT – tubeless 
Michelin XZE – 14 ply – tubeless 

 
187.50 
147.50 
462.23 

 
187.50 
147.50 
462.23 

 
190.00 
140.00 
462.23 

 
190.00 
140.00 

 
215.31 
165.31 
462.23 

 
215.31 
165.31 
462.23 

 
187.50 
147.50 
465.77 

 
187.50 
147.50 
465.77 

         
275/80 R 22.5 Michelin recap XDHT and 
casing 
295/75 R 22.5 Michelin recap XDHT and 
casing 

245.00 
 

245.00 

245.00 
 

245.00 

254.00 
 

254.00 

254.00 
 

254.00 

259.16 
 

259.16 

259.16 
 

259.16 

245.00 
 

245.00 

245.00 
 

245.00 

         
11 R 22.5 
Michelin recap XDHT and casing – tubeless 
Michelin recap XDHT – tubeless 
Michelin XZE-2 – 14 ply – tubeless 
Michelin XDN-2 – 14 ply - tubeless 

 
237.50 
162.50 
474.41 
490.04 

 
237.50 
162.50 
474.41 
490.04 

 
257.00 
157.00 
474.41 
490.04 

 
257.00 
157.00 

 
287.64 
177.64 
474.41 

 
287.64 
177.64 
474.41 

 
237.50 
162.50 
478.07 

 

 
237.50 
162.50 
478.07 

 

         
Credit offer for good carcasses 11 R 22.5 
Credit offer for good carcasses 10 R 22.5 

50.00 
25.00 

50.00 
25.00 

65.00 
25.00 

65.00 
25.00 

50.00 
0 

50.00 
0 

50.00 
30.00 

50.00 
30.00 

         

Tire Disposal Fee – any size NC NC 5.00 5.00 8.00 8.00 No charge. No charge. 

            
 *RECOMMEND for 2013-2014 
 
 **Retread pricing firm. New tire pricing subject to change, firm on new tires till end of year.  I have no control over new tires. Michelin controls new tire pricing. 
 ***Manufacturers reserve the right to increase prices without notice.  Our bid is firm unless manufacturer increases prices during the bid period. 
 
 
 

DRAFT



Camdenton R-III School District 
Bids for 2013-2014 School Year 
Due June 24, 2013  -  10:00  a.m. 
 
 
 
 

PETROLEUM Terminal Origin – Freight rate from specified terminal to Camdenton School 
 
 

 
Belle 

 
Mt. Vernon 

 
Jefferson City 

 
St. Louis 

Williams Pipeline 
Springfield 

Williams Pipeline 
Columbia 

*Lakeland Oil Co LLC Closed .0734 .0484 .1247 .0612 .0612 

Petroleum Traders Corp 
   No pickup for Sunrise    
    Beach or Osage Beach. 
 

N/A .0711 .0469 .1056 .0582 .0598 

MFA Oil NO BID      

Energy Companies NO BID      

--Last Year’s-- 
       BID 
Lakeland Oil Co. LLC 

Closed. .0753 .0525 .117 .0639 .0665 

 
 

 
*Lakeland 

Oil 
Co LLC 

Petroleum 
Traders 

Corp 
MFA Oil Energy 

Companies 

--Last Year’s-- 
BID 

Lakeland Oil 
Profit per gallon to nearest tenth of a cent  - for transport loads. .01 .0039 NO BID NO BID .01 
Profit per gallon to nearest tenth of a cent – for tank wagon 
deliveries.  .055 .0650   .055 

Cost per treated gallon of fuel for anti-gel fuel additive .034 .0250   .034 

Cost per treated gallon of fuel for algaecide additive .057 .0350   .057 
 
 
 *RECOMMEND for 2013-2014 DRAFT




